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Amenities

Legend

DTLA
700 S Flower Street | Suite 1000
Los Angeles, CA 90017

Lounge Phone/Wellness Room

•

•

•

•

•

•

On-site dining, shopping and movie theater

In-building Parking

Above Plaza Level Metro Stop

On-site fitness center

Outdoor courtyard lounge

On-site hotel



Meeting Rooms in Los Angeles

Member Rate $80/hr |  $480/day
Non-member Rate $100/hr |  $600/day

Wi-Fi, television,
conference phone, whiteboard

Member Rate $60/hr |  $360/day
Non-Member Rate $80/hr | $480/day

Wi-Fi, television,
conference phone, whiteboard

Member Rate $80/hr |  $480/day
Non-Member Rate $100/hr |  $600/day

Wi-Fi, television,
conference phone, whiteboard

All reservations are subject to availability. 
*In-room beverage service required for 
10+ people.  Member: 1 hour minimum 
reservation. Non-members: 2 hour
minimum reservation.

Cancellation Policy: Members can cancel 
up to 24 hours before the start of the 
meeting with no charge. Non-members 
can cancel up to 72 hours before the start 
of the meeting with no charge. 
Reservation changes are subject to 
additional charges.

All reservations before 8:30 am or after 
5:00 pm must be coordinated with a 
center team member and are subject to 
additional charges.

WILSHIRE – 8 Guests

SUNSET – 14 Guests

Member Rate $60/hr |  $360/day
Non-Member Rate $80/hr |  $480/day

Wi-Fi, television,
conference phone, whiteboard

OLYMPIC – 8 Guests

700 S Flower Street,  Suite 1000 
Los Angeles, CA 90017

DAY OFFICE – 1- 2 Guests

Member Rate $25/hr |  $150/day
Non-Member Rate $45/hr |  $270/day

Wi-Fi, telephone

VENICE – 14 Guests

https://carrworkplaces.com/workreadyplus/
https://carrworkplaces.com/workreadyplus/
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